
Indicates Awarded Vendor

Indicates Pricing Withdrawn

Indicates Non-Responsive Response

Chemical Withdrawn from Bid

BRAND NAME PRODUCTS

[NO SUBSTITUTIONS]
CONTAINER SIZE UNIT SIZE

Alligare, LLC

(AL)

Helena Agri 

Enterprises, LLC

(HAE)

Nutrien Ag 

Solutions Inc

(NAS)

Red River 

Specialties

(RRS)

SiteOne 

Landscape 

Supply

(SOLS)

Winfield 

United

(WU)

AWARD

AquaStrike® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $59.90 $59.90 No Bid No Bid $59.90 HAE

AquaStrike® 250 gallons gallon No Bid $59.00 $59.90 No Bid No Bid $59.00 HAE

Aquathol® K 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $74.75 $74.75 No Bid

$90.54

*non-

responsive*

$74.75 HAE

Aquathol® K 30 gallons gallon No Bid $74.75 $74.75 No Bid No Bid $74.75 HAE

Aquathol® K 250 gallons gallon No Bid $73.25 $73.25 No Bid No Bid $73.25 HAE

Aquathol® Super K 10 pounds (x 4) pound No Bid $23.45 $23.45 No Bid $24.58 $23.45 WU

Aquathol® Super K 20 pounds (x 2) pound No Bid $19.30 $19.30 No Bid No Bid $19.30 HAE

Capstone® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $53.81 $52.00 HAE

Clearcast® 1 quart quart No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.76 $115.00 No Bid RRS

Clearcast® 1 gallon gallon No Bid $276.54 $276.54 $276.54 $425.00 $224.90 RRS

Clearcast® 15 gallons gallon No Bid $275.81 $275.81 $275.81 No Bid $224.90 HAE

Clearcast® 250 gallons gallon No Bid $266.91 $266.91 $266.91 No Bid No Bid RRS

Clipper® 1 pound pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $154.22 No Bid SOLS

Clipper® 5 pounds pound No Bid $45.00 $39.50 $48.95 No Bid $54.99 NAS

Escort® XP 16 ounces ounce No Bid $5.12 $2.38 $2.60 No Bid $3.23 NAS

Derigo™ 60 ounces ounce No Bid $7.78 $7.78 $7.78 No Bid

$466.80 

($7.78 per 

ounce)

WU

EsplAnade™ 200 SC 1 quart quart No Bid $327.04 $327.04 $327.04 No Bid $327.04 RRS

EsplAnade™ 200 SC 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $1,179.12 $1,189.12 $1,189.12 No Bid $1,189.12 WU

Galleon® SC 1 (x 6) quart quart No Bid $599.12 $599.12 $599.12 No Bid $599.12 HAE

Galleon® SC 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $2,365.00 $2,365.00 $2,365.00 No Bid $2,270.00 HAE

Hydrothol® 191 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $77.80 $77.80 No Bid No Bid $77.80 HAE

Hydrothol® 191 250 gallons gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NB

Hydrothol® Granular 20 pounds pound No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.50 WU

Hydrothol® Granular 40 pounds pound No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid $3.50 WU
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Method® 240SL 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $322.56 $322.56 $322.56 No Bid $322.56 HAE

Milestone® 1 quart quart No Bid $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 No Bid $75.00 HAE

Milestone® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $285.00 $300.00 $300.00 $399.20 $300.00 RRS

Navigate® 50 pounds pound No Bid $3.04 $3.02 No Bid $3.30 $3.95 NAS

Oasis® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $2,396.48 $2,560.61 $2,560.61 No Bid $2,560.61 RRS

Opensight® 20 ounces ounce No Bid $5.25 $5.25 $5.25 No Bid $4.40 RRS

Opensight® 5 pounds pound No Bid No Bid $84.00 $84.00 No Bid $88.00 RRS

Renovate® 3 1 quart quart No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.25 $57.00 No Bid RRS

Renovate® 3 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $105.84 $105.84 $105.84 No Bid $105.84 WU

Renovate® 3 250 gallons gallon No Bid $103.15 $103.15 $103.15 No Bid No Bid RRS

Renovate® Max G 40 pounds pound No Bid $3.35 $3.35 $3.35 No Bid $3.35 RRS

Renovate® OTF 10 pounds pound No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.50 No Bid No Bid RRS

Renovate® OTF 40 pounds pound No Bid $3.98 $3.98 $3.98 No Bid $3.98 HAE

Sonar® A.S. 8 ounces ounce No Bid $246.00 No Bid $32.82 No Bid No Bid RRS

Sonar® A.S. 1 pint pint No Bid $450.00 $410.00 $458.12 No Bid No Bid NAS

Sonar® A.S. 1 quart quart No Bid $700.00 $765.55 $895.00 $882.00 $884.60 HAE

Sonar® A.S. 1 gallon gallon No Bid $1,989.12 $1,989.12 $1,989.12 No Bid $1,989.12 HAE

Sonar® Genesis 1 gallon gallon No Bid $285.13 $272.91 $285.13 $285.13 $285.13 NAS

Sonar® Genesis 275 gallons gallon No Bid $285.13 $272.91 $285.13 $285.13 No Bid NAS

Sonar® H4C 40 pounds pound No Bid $18.90 $18.90 $18.90 No Bid No Bid HAE

SonarOne® 20 pounds pound No Bid $33.63 $32.16 $33.63 $33.63 $672.60 NAS

Sonar® PR 30 pounds pound No Bid $38.05 $38.05 $38.05 No Bid $38.05 HAE

Sonar® Q 8 pounds pound No Bid No Bid $43.00 $48.75 $49.00 No Bid NAS

Sonar® Q 40 pounds pound No Bid $33.99 $33.99 $33.99 No Bid $33.99 RRS

Sonar® SRP 40 pounds pound No Bid $34.25 $34.25 $34.25 No Bid $34.25 HAE

Stingray® 1 quart quart No Bid $94.00 $94.00 $94.00 No Bid $94.00 WU
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Stingray® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $375.00 $375.00 $375.00 No Bid $375.00 WU

TIGR® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $287.23 $287.23 $326.40 No Bid $326.40 HAE

Tradewind™ 2 pounds pound No Bid $502.40 $502.40 No Bid No Bid $502.40 WU

Transline® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $147.36 $148.00 $161.86 $463.30 $160.80 HAE

Trycera® 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HAE

*Chemical withdrawn from 

bid*

Vanquish®

2.5 gallons gallon No Bid Discontinued No Bid Discontinued $72.00 $42.38 ---

Vastlan™ 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $87.50 $87.50 $87.50 No Bid $87.50 HAE

Velossa™ 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $114.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HAE

Velossa™ 30 gallons gallon No Bid $115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HAE

Velossa™ 250 gallons gallon No Bid $113.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HAE

Velpar® DF 4 pounds pound No Bid No Bid $36.95 No Bid No Bid

$32.50

*non-

responsive*

NAS

Viewpoint® 5 pounds pound No Bid $69.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HAE

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES.  ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT.  OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME.  ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.

NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING REQUIREMENT.  ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION 120.57(3)(b), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE 

TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST.  A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR SATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT.  WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN 

THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING.  FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES' REQUESTS FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE 

REQUESTING AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED.  IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY MAY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND.  FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST, WILL 

RESULT IN A DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.
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Indicates Awarded Vendor

Indicates Pricing Withdrawn

Indicates Non-Responsive Response

Withdrawn from Bid

HERBICIDE

GENERIC PRODUCTS
NAME OF PRODUCT CONTAINER SIZE UNIT SIZE

Alligare, LLC

(AL)

Helena Agri 

Enterprises, LLC

(HAE)

Nutrien Ag 

Solutions Inc

(NAS)

Red River 

Specialties

(RRS)

SiteOne 

Landscape 

Supply

(SOLS)

Winfield 

United

(WU)

AWARD

2,4-D amine 46% (aquatic) Platoon 2.5 gallons gallon $10.25 $10.75 $10.10 $11.58 No Bid $13.49 NAS

2,4-D amine 46% (aquatic) Alligare 2,4-D amine 30 gallons gallon $10.00 $10.30

$9.79

*non-

responsive*

$11.28 No Bid No Bid AL

bentazon 44% Gazon Next HL 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $56.50 $42.00 $99.98 No Bid $68.75 NAS

carbaryl 43% Carbaryl 4L 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid $42.83 $40.50 No Bid $48.80 $42.37 NAS

copper sulfate pentahydrate 99% Chem One Copper Sulfate 50 pounds pound No Bid $1.45 $1.25 No Bid $2.50 $1.45 NAS

dicamba, dimethylamine salt Weedar64 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid No Bid $35.60 $39.95 $16.80 No Bid SOLS

diquat dibromide 37.3% (aquatic) Alligare Diquat 2.5 gallons gallon $34.90 $35.50 $35.44 $40.86 $44.80 $39.99 AL

diquat dibromide 37.3% (aquatic) Tribune 120 gallons gallon No Bid $37.06 $36.97 No Bid $79.00 No Bid NAS

diquat dibromide 37.3% (aquatic) Diquat SPC 250 gallons gallon

$34.50

*non-

responsive*

$37.06 $36.80 $39.95 No Bid No Bid NAS

flumioxazin 44% (aquatic) Flumigard SC 2.5 gallons gallon $264.00 $355.30 $327.70 No Bid No Bid $440.00 AL

flumioxazin 51% (aquatic) Flumigard 1 pound pound $32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AL

flumioxazin 51% (aquatic) Flumigard 5 pounds pound $31.00 $42.00 $39.40 $52.95 No Bid $54.99 AL

fluridone 41.7% (aquatic) Alligare Fluridone 1 pint pint
$225.60 ($14.10 

per ounce)
No Bid $410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid AL

fluridone 41.7% (aquatic) Alligare Fluridone 1 quart quart $315.00 No Bid $765.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid AL

fluridone 41.7% (aquatic) Alligare Fluridone 1 gallon gallon $1,190.00 $1,820.00 $1,812.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid AL

fluridone 5% (aquatic) NB 20 pounds pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NB

glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic) Ranger Pro 2.5 gallons gallon
$15.85

*Withdrawn*

$16.79

*Withdrawn*

$15.66

*Withdrawn*

$16.10

*Withdrawn*
$21.20 $16.99 WU

glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic) Roundup Custom 30 gallons gallon
$14.30

*Withdrawn*
$16.55

$15.34

*Withdrawn*

$15.90

*Withdrawn*
$20.33 $16.89 HAE

glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic) NB 250 gallons gallon

$14.22

*non-

responsive*

$16.00

*Withdrawn*

$16.34

*non-

responsive*

$15.30

*Withdrawn*

$18.87

*Withdrawn*

$16.79

*Withdrawn*
NB

glyphosate 41% (terrestrial) NB 2.5 gallons gallon
$12.90

*Withdrawn*

$12.23

*Withdrawn*

$11.68

*Withdrawn*

$11.98

*Withdrawn*

$15.20

*Withdrawn*

$11.75

*Withdrawn*
NB

glyphosate 41% (terrestrial) NB 30 gallons gallon
$12.60 

*Withdrawn*

$11.72

*Withdrawn*

$11.22

*Withdrawn*

$11.85

*Withdrawn*

$13.83

*Withdrawn*

$11.10

*Withdrawn*
NB

glyphosate 41% (terrestrial) NB 250 gallons gallon

$11.25

*non-

responsive*

$11.46/gal in 265 tote

*non-responsive*

$11.12

*non-

responsive*

$11.10

*Withdrawn*

$14.34

*Withdrawn*

$10.89

*non-

responsive*

NB
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Indicates Awarded Vendor

Indicates Pricing Withdrawn

Indicates Non-Responsive Response

Withdrawn from Bid

HERBICIDE

GENERIC PRODUCTS
NAME OF PRODUCT CONTAINER SIZE UNIT SIZE

Alligare, LLC

(AL)

Helena Agri 

Enterprises, LLC

(HAE)

Nutrien Ag 

Solutions Inc

(NAS)

Red River 

Specialties

(RRS)

SiteOne 

Landscape 

Supply

(SOLS)

Winfield 

United

(WU)

AWARD

FWC 19/20-94 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

hydrogen peroxide algaecide Green Clean 5.0 2.5 gallons gallon No Bid No Bid $20.62 No Bid No Bid $24.99 NAS

imazamox 12.1% Alligare IMOX 1 quart quart $65.00 No Bid No Bid $99.76 No Bid No Bid AL

imazamox 12.1% Castaway 1 gallon gallon $235.00 $225.00 No Bid $276.54 No Bid No Bid HAE

imazamox 12.1% Clearcast 15 gallons gallon No Bid $275.81 No Bid $275.81 No Bid No Bid HAE

imazamox 12.1% Alligare IMOX 250 gallons gallon $220.00 $266.91 No Bid $266.91 No Bid No Bid AL

imazapic 23.6% Alligare Panoramic 25L 1 gallon gallon $94.00 $105.00 $119.60 $112.89 $140.00 $143.90 AL

imazapic 23.6% Alligare Panoramic 25L 2.5 gallons gallon $92.00 $104.00 $115.40 $110.76 $135.82 No Bid AL

imazapic 23.6% 30 gallons gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NB

imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic) Alligare Ecomazapyr 2.5 gallons gallon $45.00 $51.00 $47.88 $52.95 $83.95 $51.99 AL

imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic) Arsenal Herbicide 15 gallons gallon No Bid No Bid $62.00 $51.86 No Bid No Bid RRS

imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic) Alligare Ecomazapyr 30 gallons gallon $46.50 No Bid No Bid $51.18 No Bid No Bid AL

imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic) Polaris 250 gallons gallon

$46.25

*non-

responsive*

$51.00 $46.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid NAS

imazapyr 53% Alligare Imazapyr 4 2.5 gallons gallon $87.80 No Bid $94.56 $100.00 No Bid $101.98 AL

metsulfuron-methyl 60% Alligare MSM 60 CF 16 ounces ounce $2.25 $3.58 $2.38 $2.60 $4.94 $3.23 AL

triclopyr amine 14% (aquatic) NB 40 pounds pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NB

triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic) Element 3A 2.5 gallons gallon $32.00 $30.92 $31.20 $33.10 $71.20 $34.99 HAE

triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic) Garlon 3A 15 gallons gallon No Bid No Bid $45.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid NAS

triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic) Alligare Triclopyr 3 30 gallons gallon $29.80 $30.89 $31.02 $33.00 No Bid $34.89 AL

triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic) Garlon 3A 250 gallons gallon

$29.75

*non-

responsive*

$36.00 $44.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid HAE

triclopyr ester 61.6% Element 4 2.5 gallons gallon $38.55 $36.80 $37.20 $39.05 $57.20 $42.29 HAE

triclopyr ester 61.6% Garlon 4 Ultra 15 gallons gallon No Bid No Bid $66.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid NAS

triclopyr ester 61.6% Alligare Triclopyr 4 30 gallons gallon $35.55 $36.22 $36.67 $38.78 $55.00 $41.89 AL
FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES.  ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT.  OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME.  ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.

NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING REQUIREMENT.  ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION 120.57(3)(b), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT 

THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST.  A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR SATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT.  WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST 

HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING.  FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO AGENCIES' REQUESTS FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT 

OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED.  IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY MAY, IN EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND.  FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL 

PROTEST, WILL RESULT IN A DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.
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Indicates Awarded Vendor

Indicates Pricing Withdrawn

ADJUVANTS 

GENERIC PRODUCTS
NAME OF PRODUCT CONTAINER SIZE UNIT SIZE

Alligare, LLC

(AL)

Helena Agri 

Enterprises, LLC

(HAE)

Nutrien Ag 

Solutions Inc

(NAS)

Red River 

Specialties

(RRS)

SiteOne 

Landscape 

Supply

(SOLS)

Winfield 

United

(WU)

AWARD

antifoamer/defoamer Fast Break 1 gallon gallon No Bid $30.00 $23.25 $20.48 $34.40 $19.99 WU

methylated seed oil 

concentrate
MSO by Brewer 2.5 gallons gallon $16.40 No Bid $9.88 $9.89 $13.20 $18.99 NAS

oil carrier blue/red Bark Oil red/blue 2.5 gallons gallon $15.78 $16.50 $12.10 $14.18 No Bid No Bid NAS

oil carrier blue/red Bark Oil red/blue 11.25 (15) gallons gallon $16.57 $14.10 $9.90 $13.98 No Bid $8.98 NAS

oil carrier blue/red Bark Oil red/blue 15 gallons gallon No Bid $11.00 $9.90 $13.98 No Bid No Bid NAS

oil carrier blue/red Bark Oil red/blue 30 gallons gallon No Bid $11.78 $9.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid NAS

polyacrylamide drift 

inhibitor
Improved JLB Oil Plus 1 gallon gallon No Bid $10.95 $16.00 $24.89 No Bid $25.67 HAE

polyacrylamide sinking 

agent
Syndetic 1 gallon gallon No Bid $35.00 $28.50 No Bid No Bid $25.67 WU

spray indicator dye Spec Spray Indicator 1 gallon gallon $31.83 $16.00 $21.00 $17.69 $16.80 $22.99 HAE

surfactant, 90% nonionic RRSI NIS 2.5 gallons gallon $9.77 $11.50 $9.94 $9.76 $13.20 $16.99 RRS

surfactant, 100% 

organosilicone
Elite Marvel 2.5 gallons gallon $34.02 $41.00 $36.84 $29.12 $44.00 $59.00 RRS

surfactant, oil of 

limonene
Cide Kick 2.5 gallons gallon $18.00 $18.60 $14.98 $15.96 No Bid $19.99 NAS

surfactant, 

organosilicone and MSO
MSO by Brewer 2.5 gallons gallon $22.65 $41.00 $9.98 $24.96 No Bid $31.99 NAS

water 

conditioner/buffering 

agent

Elite Imperial 2.5 gallons gallon $15.22 $21.00 $12.20 $11.96 $12.00 $19.99 RRS

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES.  ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND 

ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT.  OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME.  ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN 

RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.

NOTICE OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING REQUIREMENT.  ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENDED DECISION PERTAINING TO CONTRACTS ADMINISTERED BY THE DIVISION OR A STATE AGENCY PURSUANT TO SECTION 120.57(3)(b), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL POST WITH 

THE DIVISION OR THE STATE AGENCY AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST.  A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DIVISION OR SATE AGENCY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE DIVISION'S OR STATE AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE TOTAL VOLUME OF THE CONTRACT.  WHICH BOND SHALL BE 

CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND IN ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDING.  FOR PROTEST OF DECISIONS OR INTENDED DECISIONS OF THE DIVISION PERTAINING TO 

AGENCIES' REQUESTS FOR APPROVAL OF EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASES, THE BOND SHALL BE IN THE AMOUNT EQUAL TO 1 PERCENT OF THE REQUESTING AGENCY'S ESTIMATE OF THE CONTRACT AMOUNT FOR THE EXCEPTIONAL PURCHASE REQUESTED.  IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE DIVISION OR STATE AGENCY MAY, IN 

EITHER CASE, ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE BOND.  FAILURE TO FILE THE PROPER BOND AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL PROTEST, WILL RESULT IN A DENIAL OF THE PROTEST.
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