

STATE OF FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: DOT-ITB-22-9009-JM

BID TITLE: Adopt-A-Highway Items

FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHER SECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES.

OPENING DATE: 08/31/2021 TIME: 10:00AM

OPENED BY: S. Johnson

POSTING TIME/DATE FROM: Monday, September 27, 2021 @ 10AM EST

UNTIL: Thursday, September 30, 2021 @ 10AM EST

VENDOR	PRICE	INTENDED AWARD
Unipak Corp (Non-Responsive)	PLEASE SEE ATTACHED PAGES BELOW	
Kolossus Workwear Corp		
Central Poly Bag Corp.		
Heatherdale Stitchery		
J3 Enterprises		
Safety Products Inc.		
JW WorkZone Supplies LLC		

Receipt of No Competitive Bids

Evaluated by: Renee Matthews

JUSTIFICATION FOR AWARD OF SINGLE BID: _____

The Intended Award Indicates apparent awarded vendor, but does not constitute an acceptance of any offer created by vendor's bid. No binding contract will be deemed to exist until such time as a Purchase Order or written acceptance by the Department has been issued. If irregularities are subsequently discovered in the vendor's bid or if the vendor fails to submit required Bonds and Insurance, or otherwise fails to comply with the bid requirements, the Department has the Right to Award to the vendor that is second low, reject all bids, or act in the best interest of the Department.

VENDOR	Unipak Corp	Kolossus Workwear	Central Poly Bag	Heatherdale Stitchery	J3 Enterprises	Safety Products	JW WorkZone	Intended Award
ITEM								
Safety Vest								
1. Small Vest (DOT #111825)		\$4.59	No Bid	\$4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc.
2. Medium Vest (DOT# 111826)		4.59	No Bid	4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc
3. Large Vest (DOT# 111827)		4.59	No Bid	4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc
4. X-Large Vest (DOT# 111828)		4.59	No Bid	4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc
5. 2XL Vest (DOT# 111829)		4.59	No Bid	4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc
6. 3XL Vest (DOT# 111830)		4.69	No Bid	4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc
7. 4XL Vest (DOT# 111831)		4.69	No Bid	4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc
8 5XL Vest (DOT#111832)		4.79	No Bid	4.25	8.00	3.26	7.95	Safety Products, Inc
9. Trash Tongs (DOT# 339210)		No Bid	No Bid	17.88	35.00	No Bid	No Bid	Heatherdale Stitchery
10. Trash Bags (DOT#924004)		No Bid	\$85.00	\$72.72	\$17.00	No Bid	No Bid	Heatherdale Stitchery