

## FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

BRAND NAME PRODUCTS [NO SUBSTITUTIONS]	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
AquaStrike®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$53.80</b>	\$53.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$53.80	CPS
AquaStrike®	250 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$52.90</b>	\$52.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.90	CPS
Aquathol® K	2.5 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$70.50</b>	\$70.50	No Bid	\$79.72	\$70.50	CPS
Aquathol® K	30 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$70.50</b>	\$70.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$70.50	CPS
Aquathol® K	250 gallon	No Bid	\$69.05	<b>\$69.05</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$69.05	HAE
Aquathol® Super K	10 pound	No Bid	\$21.95	No bid	No Bid	<b>\$21.64</b>	\$21.95	SOL
Aquathol® Super K	20 pound	No Bid	<b>\$18.25</b>	\$18.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.25	CPS
Avast®	1 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$1,403.92</b>	\$1,700.00	\$1,403.92	\$1,865.67	\$1,959.59	CPS
Capstone®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$40.00	\$40.00	No Bid	\$50.11	<b>\$40.00</b>	WIN
Clearcast®	1 quart	No Bid	No bid	No bid	<b>\$81.26</b>	No Bid	No Bid	RRS
Clearcast®	1 gallon	No Bid	\$271.12	<b>\$271.12</b>	\$271.12	\$299.78	No Bid	HAE
Clearcast®	15 gallon	No Bid	\$270.40	<b>\$270.40</b>	\$270.40	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Clearcast®	250 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$261.68</b>	\$261.68	\$261.68	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Clipper®	1 pound	\$90.00	No bid	\$98.00	<b>\$73.68</b>	\$128.49	\$104.99	RRS
Clipper®	5 pound	<b>\$40.00</b>	\$98.00	\$95.00	\$72.92	No Bid	\$94.99	ALI
Escort® XP	16 ounce	No Bid	<b>\$2.18</b>	\$4.09	\$2.28	\$5.69	\$2.89	CPS
Derigo™	60 ounce	No Bid	\$7.30	<b>\$7.30</b>	\$7.30	No Bid	\$7.30	HAE
EsplAnade™ 200 SC	1 quart	No Bid	\$309.76	\$309.76	\$309.76	No Bid	<b>\$309.76</b>	WIN
EsplAnade™ 200 SC	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$1,113.60	\$1,113.60	\$1,113.60	No Bid	<b>\$1,113.60</b>	WIN
Galleon® SC	1 quart	No Bid	\$575.86	\$575.96	<b>\$575.86</b>	No Bid	No Bid	RRS
Galleon® SC	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$2,246.00	No bid	<b>\$2,246.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid	RRS
Hydrothol® 191	2.5 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$73.55</b>	\$73.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$73.55	CPS
Hydrothol® 191	250 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$73.55</b>	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Hydrothol® Granular	20 pound	No Bid	\$3.30	<b>\$3.30</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.30	HAE
Hydrothol® Granular	40 pound	No Bid	\$3.30	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$3.30</b>	WIN
Method® 240SL	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$318.72	<b>\$318.72</b>	\$318.72	No Bid	\$318.72	HAE
Milestone®	1 quart	No Bid	<b>\$79.38</b>	\$79.38	\$79.38	No Bid	\$79.38	CPS
Milestone®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$312.50	\$312.50	<b>\$312.50</b>	\$363.99	\$312.50	RRS
Navigate®	50 pound	No Bid	<b>\$2.94</b>	\$3.05	No Bid	\$3.02	\$3.54	CPS

## FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

BRAND NAME PRODUCTS [NO SUBSTITUTIONS]	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
Oasis®	1 quart	No Bid	\$662.75	\$662.75	<b>\$662.75</b>	No Bid	No Bid	RRS
Opensight®	20 ounce	No Bid	\$87.50	No bid	\$87.60	No Bid	<b>\$87.50</b>	WIN
Opensight®	5 pound	No Bid	\$87.50	No bid	<b>\$87.50</b>	No Bid	\$87.50	RRS
Perspective®	20 ounce	No Bid	<b>\$92.32</b>	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Perspective®	5 pound	No Bid	<b>\$92.32</b>	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Renovate® 3	1 quart	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No Bid	<b>\$43.92</b>	No Bid	SOL
Renovate® 3	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$101.73	<b>\$101.73</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Renovate® 3	250 gallon	No Bid	\$99.14	<b>\$99.14</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Renovate® Max G	40 pound	No Bid	\$3.21	<b>\$3.21</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Renovate® OTF	10 pound	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NB
Renovate® OTF	40 pound	No Bid	\$3.82	<b>\$3.82</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Sonar® A.S.	8 ounce	No Bid	<b>\$26.63</b>	\$27.71	\$27.17	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Sonar® A.S.	1 pint	No Bid	\$365.73	<b>\$24.05</b>	\$377.43	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Sonar® A.S.	1 quart	No Bid	\$640.85	<b>\$22.76</b>	\$714.26	\$772.79	No Bid	HAE
Sonar® A.S.	1 gallon	No Bid	\$1,979.22	\$1,979.22	<b>\$1,979.22</b>	No Bid	No Bid	RRS
Sonar® Genesis	1 gallon	No Bid	\$276.00	\$276.00	\$313.64	<b>\$276.00</b>	\$299.99	SOL
Sonar® Genesis	275 gallon	No Bid	<b>\$276.00</b>	No bid	\$313.64	\$276.00	\$299.99	CPS
Sonar® H4C	40 pound	No Bid	\$17.99	<b>\$17.99</b>	\$17.99	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
SonarOne®	20 pound	No Bid	\$32.47	<b>\$32.47</b>	\$36.90	\$32.47	\$34.11	HAE
Sonar® PR	30 pound	No Bid	\$36.56	<b>\$36.56</b>	\$36.56	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Sonar® Q	8 pound	No Bid	<b>\$37.53</b>	No bid	\$41.81	\$41.08	No Bid	CPS
Sonar® Q	40 pound	No Bid	<b>\$30.84</b>	No bid	\$30.84	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Sonar® SRP	40 pound	No Bid	<b>\$31.68</b>	\$31.68	\$31.68	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Stingray®	1 quart	No Bid	\$153.14	<b>\$153.14</b>	\$153.14	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Stingray®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$532.68	<b>\$532.68</b>	\$532.68	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Streamline®	3 pound	No Bid	<b>\$103.04</b>	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
Streamline®	20 pound	No Bid	<b>\$103.04</b>	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CPS
TIGR®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$320.00	<b>\$320.00</b>	\$320.00	No Bid	\$349.00	HAE
Tradewind™	2 pound	No Bid	<b>\$541.05</b>	\$565.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$541.06	CPS

## FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

BRAND NAME PRODUCTS [NO SUBSTITUTIONS]	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
Transline®	½ gallon	No Bid	\$74.40	No bid	\$69.87	No Bid	\$83.16	RRS
Transline®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$148.80	\$170.00	\$139.75	\$204.73	\$166.31	RRS
Trycera®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	No bid	\$80.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	HAE
Vastlan™	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$75.90	\$86.00	\$65.36	No Bid	\$86.00	RRS
Vanquish®	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$48.60	\$44.00	\$41.05	\$66.62	\$47.51	RRS
Velpar® DF	4 pound	No Bid	\$28.50	No bid	\$27.21	No Bid	No Bid	RRS
Velpar® L	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$77.60	\$79.00	\$74.44	No Bid	\$99.99	RRS
Velpar® L	15 gallon	No Bid	\$77.40	No bid	\$74.16	No Bid	\$99.99	RRS
Viewpoint®	5 pound	No Bid	\$69.12	\$69.12	\$69.12	No Bid	\$69.12	WIN
Viewpoint®	20 pound	No Bid	No bid	\$69.12	\$69.12	No Bid	No Bid	HAE

FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

HERBICIDE GENERIC PRODUCTS	NAME OF PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
2,4-D amine 46% (aquatic)	Alligare 2, 4-D	2.5 gallon	\$9.90	\$9.96	\$15.50	\$10.29	\$20.84	\$14.50	ALI
2,4-D amine 46% (aquatic)	Weedar 64	15 gallon	No Bid	\$12.50	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	CPS
2,4-D amine 46% (aquatic)	Platoon	30 gallon	\$9.80	\$9.80	\$15.00	\$10.06	No bid	\$13.99	CPS
2,4-D amine 46% (aquatic)	Alligare 2, 4-D	270 gallon	\$9.70	\$9.70	\$15.00	\$9.49	No bid	\$13.59	RRS
ammonium salt of imazamox 12.1%	Alligare Imox	1 quart	\$68.00	No bid	No bid	\$81.26	No bid	No bid	ALI
ammonium salt of imazamox 12.1%	Alligare Imox	1 gallon	\$232.00	\$271.12	\$271.12	\$271.12	No bid	No bid	ALI
ammonium salt of imazamox 12.1%	Alligare Imox	15 gallon	\$230.85	\$270.40	No bid	\$270.40	No bid	No bid	ALI
ammonium salt of imazamox 12.1%	Alligare Imox	265 gallon	\$225.00	\$261.68	\$261.68	\$261.68	No bid	No bid	ALI
bentazon 44%	Basagran T&O	2.5 gallon	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$91.58	\$69.95	\$60.96	WIN
carbaryl 43%	Seven SL	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$38.20	\$35.00	\$41.58	\$37.76	\$49.99	HAE
copper sulfate pentahydrate 99%	Applied Bio	15 pound	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$2.91	No bid	SOL
copper sulfate pentahydrate 99%	Chem One Copper	50 pound	No Bid	\$1.45	\$1.50	No bid	No bid	\$1.65	CPS
dicamba, dimethylamine salt	Rifle	2.5 gallon	\$40.00	\$39.68	\$96.00	\$41.18	\$66.62	No bid	CPS
diquat dibromide 37.3% (aquatic)	Tribune	2.5 gallon	\$44.00	\$35.75	\$37.25	\$48.45	\$42.71	\$42.99	CPS
diquat dibromide 37.3% (aquatic)	Tribune	20 gallon	No Bid	No bid	\$37.25	No bid	No bid	No bid	HAE

FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

HERBICIDE GENERIC PRODUCTS	NAME OF PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
diquat dibromide 37.3% (aquatic)	Tribune	250 gallon	\$43.00	\$37.15	\$37.25	\$47.84	No bid	No bid	CPS
flumioxazin 44% (aquatic)	Clipper SC	2.5 gallon	No Bid	\$720.00	\$590.00	No bid	No bid	\$719.92	HAE
flumioxazin 51% (aquatic)	Payload	1 pound	\$90.00	No bid	\$98.00	\$67.37	No bid	\$104.99	RRS
flumioxazin 51% (aquatic)	Payload	12 pound	\$90.00	\$90.20	\$90.42	\$67.37	No bid	\$94.99	RRS
fluridone 41.7% (aquatic)	Alligare Fluridone	1 pint	\$14.07	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	ALI
fluridone 41.7% (aquatic)	Alligare Fluridone	1 quart	\$314.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	ALI
fluridone 41.7% (aquatic)	Alligare Fluridone	1 gallon	\$1,198.00	No bid	No bid	\$1,403.92	No bid	No bid	ALI
fluridone 5% (aquatic)	N/A	20 pound	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	NB
glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic)	Aqua Neat	2.5 gallon	\$15.65	\$14.65	\$16.66	\$15.26	\$19.08	\$19.00	CPS
glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic)	Aqua Neat	15 gallon	No Bid	\$16.43	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	CPS
glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic)	Aqua Neat	30 gallon	\$14.75	\$14.42	\$16.45	\$14.84	\$18.79	\$19.00	CPS
glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic)	Aqua Neat	250 gallon	\$14.65	\$14.12	\$15.98	\$14.51	\$18.74	\$18.99	CPS
glyphosate 41% (terrestrial)	Mad Dog Plus	2.5 gallon	\$12.35	\$10.40	\$12.22	\$12.96	\$12.24	\$13.23	CPS
glyphosate 41% (terrestrial)	N/A	15 gallon	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	NB
glyphosate 41% (terrestrial)	Mad Dog Plus	30 gallon	\$11.55	\$9.98	\$11.65	\$12.28	\$11.67	\$12.22	CPS

FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

HERBICIDE GENERIC PRODUCTS	NAME OF PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
glyphosate 41% (terrestrial)	Mad Dog Plus	260 gallon	\$11.45	\$9.44	No bid	No bid	\$12.53	\$12.22	CPS
hydrogen peroxide algaecide	Greenclean 5.0	5 gallon	No Bid	\$25.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$28.99	CPS
imazapic 23.6%	Panoramic 2SL	1 gallon	\$91.00	\$113.00	\$115.91	\$104.50	\$121.98	\$139.00	ALI
imazapic 23.6%	Panoramic 2SL	2.5 gallon	\$90.00	No bid	\$113.64	\$104.50	\$119.58	No bid	ALI
imazapic 23.6%	Plateau	30 gallon	No Bid	\$111.00	No bid	\$104.50	No bid	No bid	RRS
imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic)	Ecomazapyr 2SL	2.5 gallon	\$41.10	\$44.30	\$47.70	\$50.84	\$73.91	\$54.00	ALI
imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic)	Arsenal	15 gallon	No Bid	\$47.20	No bid	\$49.15	No bid	No bid	CPS
imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic)	Ecomazapyr 2SL	30 gallon	\$41.90	No bid	No bid	\$48.09	No bid	No bid	ALI
imazapyr 22.6% (aquatic)	Ecomazapyr 2SL	250 gallon	\$41.60	\$43.30	\$46.60	\$47.89	No bid	\$52.50	ALI
imazapyr 53%	Alligare Imazapyr 4SL	2.5 gallon	\$85.50	\$118.00	No bid	\$94.26	No bid	\$116.00	ALI
metsulfuron-methyl 60%	Alligare MSM 60	16 ounce	\$1.90	\$2.18	No bid	\$2.28	\$4.87	\$2.89	ALI
triclopyr amine 14% (aquatic)	N/A	10 pound	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	NB
triclopyr amine 14% (aquatic)	Renovate OTF	40 pound	No Bid	\$3.82	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	CPS
triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic)	Garlon 3A	2.5 gallon	\$31.50	\$31.22	\$31.80	\$31.68	\$50.68	\$49.99	CPS
triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic)	Garlon 3A	15 gallon	No Bid	\$35.10	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	CPS
triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic)	Garlon 3A	30 gallon	\$31.25	\$31.10	\$31.80	\$31.68	No bid	\$49.99	CPS

FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

HERBICIDE GENERIC PRODUCTS	NAME OF PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
triclopyr amine 44.4% (aquatic)	Alligare Triclopyr 3 SL	250 gallon	\$31.00	\$34.10	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	ALI
triclopyr ester 61.6%	Alligare Triclopyr 4cc	2.5 gallon	\$37.30	\$38.56	\$39.00	\$38.76	\$58.52	\$78.00	ALI
triclopyr ester 61.6%	Garlon 4 Ultra	15 gallon	No Bid	\$42.56	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	CPS
triclopyr ester 61.6%	Alligare Triclopyr 4cc	30 gallon	\$37.00	\$38.38	\$39.00	\$38.76	\$52.49	\$78.00	ALI

FWC 17/18-128 HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR INVASIVE PLANT CONTROL

Indicates Awarded Vendor

ADJUVANTS GENERIC PRODUCTS	NAME OF PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	Alligare (ALI)	Crop Production Services (CPS)	Helena-Agri Enterprises (HAE)	Red River Specialties (RRS)	Site One Landscape Supply (SOL)	Winfield United (WIN)	AWARD
antifoamer/defoamer	RRSI Defoamer	1 gallon	No Bid	\$18.40	No bid	\$16.57	\$28.24	\$29.00	RRS
methyated seed oil concentrate	MSO Concentrate	2.5 gallon	\$10.70	\$9.99	\$16.00	\$10.76	\$12.88	\$26.50	CPS
oil carrier blue/red	Brewer Basil Oil Blue	2.5 gallon	\$12.10	\$9.96	\$13.21	\$12.24	No bid	No bid	CPS
oil carrier blue/red	Barkoil Red/Blue	11.25 gallon	\$11.90	\$8.99	\$9.90	\$11.96	No bid	\$12.99	CPS
oil carrier blue/red	Barkoil Red/Blue	15 gallon	No Bid	\$8.99	\$10.77	\$11.96	No bid	No bid	CPS
oil carrier blue/red	Barkoil Red/Blue	30 gallon	No Bid	\$8.99	\$10.65	\$11.96	No bid	No bid	CPS
polyacrylamide drift inhibitor	Yardage	1 gallon	No Bid	\$26.50	\$28.00	\$37.00	\$16.74	\$24.49	SOL
polyacrylamide sinking agent	Syndetic	1 gallon	No Bid	\$26.50	\$34.19	No bid	No bid	\$24.49	WIN
spray indicator dye	RRSI IVM Marking dye	1 gallon	\$29.20	\$17.66	\$17.16	\$13.44	\$15.74	\$42.00	RRS
surfactant, 90% nonionic	Alligare 90	2.5 gallon	\$8.20	\$10.78	\$11.00	\$9.18	\$12.40	\$16.99	ALI
surfactant, 100% organosilicone	Performance Wetter	2.5 gallon	\$27.00	\$34.03	\$40.52	No bid	\$40.94	No bid	ALI
surfactant, oil of limonene	Trace	2.5 gallon	\$12.00	\$16.20	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$19.98	ALI
surfactant, organosilicone and MSO	Phase	2.5 gallon	\$25.50	\$18.22	\$42.00	\$22.98	No bid	\$39.99	CPS
water conditioner/buffering agent	Elite Imperial	2.5 gallon	\$10.00	\$9.99	\$21.00	\$7.20	\$16.07	\$14.99	RRS