BID/PROPOSAL/NEGOTIATION TABULATION (PUR 7004)

Instructions: Agencies may use this form to post notices of award pursuant to s. 120.57(3), F.S. and Chapter 28-110 F.A.C. Agencies are not required to use this form. State Purchasing recommends that agencies check with their General Counsel
when creating their own alternatives to this form.

Solicitation Title: Defense Products Agency Personnel:

Solicitation Number: ITB No. 19-46000000-N

Solicitation Responses Due: Tuesday, July 7, 2015; 2:00 pm ET Opened by: Leslie Gallegos Williams, Associate Category Manager

Posting Notice of Intent to Award:

From: Tuesday, July 28, 2015, 2:00 PM ET Tabulated by: Leslie Gallegos Williams, Associate Category Manager

To: Friday, July 31, 2015, 2:00 PM ET Verified by: Stephanie Sanford, Category Manager

The State of Florida, Department of Management Services, has posted a Notice of Intended Award.
Any protest concerning this agency decision shall be made in accordance with Sections 120.57(3) and 287.042(2) of the Florida Statutes and Chapter 28-110 of the Florida Administrative Code. Failure to file a
protest within the 72 hour period as prescribed in Section 120.57(3), or failure to post a bond of $130,000.00 or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of
proceeding under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Questions or communication to the Procurement Officer shall not constitute notice of a protest. Any protest concerning this agency decision must be timely
received by the Agency Clerk at:

Department of Management Services

Agency Clerk

4050 Esplanade Way, Suite 160

Tallahassee, FL 32399-0950
Pursuant to 287.57(23) of the Florida Statutes, "Respondents to this solicitation or persons acting on their behalf may not contact, between the release of the solicitation and the end of the 72-hour period following
the agency posting the notice of intended award, excluding Saturdays, Sundays, and state holidays, any employee or officer of the executive or legislative branch concerning any aspect of this solicitation, except in
writing to the procurement officer or as provided in the solicitation documents. Violation of this provision may be grounds for rejecting a response.”

The following Bid Tabulation identifies vendors awarded.

Color Key for Bid Tabulation:

|A discount highlighted green indicates Intent to Award for the specific Manufacturer or Brand name in each Group by Line number.

A cell highlighted in red indicates that the bidder or bid was disqualified for the specific Manufacturer or Brand name in each Group by Line number.

A discount highlighted in blue indicates that the bid was not the highest for the specific Manufacturer or Brand name in each Group by Line number.

A cell highlighted light brown and may contain the text "No Bid" indicates no award will be made to the specific Manufacturer or Brand Name for that line.

See BID TABULATION on next Worksheets.

Non-Responsive Bidders Rationale

AMTEC Less Lethal Systems, Inc. . 5 . " . | .
Bidder submitted multiple ranges for same listed Manufacturer or Brand Name in Groups/Subgroup's see section 2.4 Alternate Responses.

Bidder did not provide Relevant Past Performance as required in sections: 2.3.2.1,2.3.2.2,2.3.2.3

Bidder did not provide Department of State registration form as per section 2.3.4.1.

Armament Systems and Procedures, INC Bidder did not provide Out-of State Preference Letter from Attorney as per section 2.3.4.2.

Bidder did not provide Vendor Information Form (Attachment F) as per section 2.3.1.

Bidder did not complete Attachment A Discount Sheet for Groups 7 or 9 as per section 2.7.

Bidder did not provide Department of State registration form as per section 2.3.4.1.

Combined Systems, Inc. . - — .
Bidder did not provide Out-of State Preference Letter from Attorney as per section 2.3.4.2.

Bidder did not provide Department of State registration form as per section 2.3.4.1.

Bidder did not provide Out-of State Preference Letter from Attorney as per section 2.3.4.2.

Bidder did not provide completed MSRP Certification (Attachment J) as per section 2.3.4.7.

Dana Safety Supply
Bidder submitted multiple ranges for same listed Manufacturer or Brand Name in Groups/Subgroup's see section 2.4 Alternate Responses.

Bidder did not complete Attachment A Discount Sheet for Groups 7, 8, or 9 as per section 2.7.

Bidder has outstanding transaction fees in MFMP;see section 2.6 Evaluation Criteria and FAC 60A-1.006(3)(c).

Bidder submitted contract exceptions and deviations which is not allowed as the bidder accepted the terms of this agreement as per section 2.2.3 Sourcing Tips
and Training.

Bidder did not submit a discount for submitted brand as per section 2.7 Basis of Award.

TASER International, Inc.
Bidder did not provide Out-of State Preference Letter from Attorney as per section 2.3.4.2.

Bidder did not fully comply with Certification of Drug-Free Workplace (Attachment C) as per section 2.3.4.3

Bidder did not submit a discount for Savings/Price Reduction (Attachment E) for submitted brand as per section 2.3.4.5.

The Bidders listed in the table below have had their bid PARTIALLY rejected from the Group or Sub Groups as specified below, as per sections 2.11 and 2.12.
However, Bidders may have been awarded for other Groups and/or Sub Groups where all requirements were satisfied.

Bidders Group Disqualification Rationale
Security Equipment Corporation Bidder did not complete Attachment A Discount Sheet for Groups 7 or 9 as per section 2.7.
SafariLand, LLC Bidder submitted an unaccepted brand (Breakfree) for Group 4 as per section 2.4.
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ITB No. 19-46000000-
Bid Tabulation
(REV 23 July 2015)

Defense Products
ksheet

VIEWING NOTE: Due to the width and height of this document and the available screen space of your monitor, you may need to scroll across and up-and-down this document to view all available columns and rows.

the bottom right of this window; to scroll up-and-down this document, you can use the scroll bar at the right of this window.

To scroll across this document, you can use the scroll bar in

KEY NOTE: For additional information related to this document, please see the Key toward the bottom of this document.

GROUP APPLICABLE UNSPSC CODE(S)* ITEM DESCRIPTIONS
Group 1 Handcuffs, Legcuffs, Waistchains, Keys, etc.
Group 2 From: Tuesday, July 28, 2015, 2:00 PM ET Pepper Spray/OC Spray
Group 3 Training Equipment/Materials (including K9 equip and training ammunition)
Group 4 46101800 Arms and A ition A ies (holsters, slings, gear bags, etc.)
Group 5 46151500; 46151501; 46151502; 46151503; Riot Gear and Control Mect (including tasers or stun guns)
Group 6 46151504; 46151506; 46151600; 46151602; Grenades (| le blast, hornets nest, etc.) & Smoke Bombs (including launchers)
Group 7 Handgun A ition (Duty)
Group 8 46101600; 46101601; 46101700 Shotgun and Rimfire A ition (Duty)
Groug 9 Rifle Ammunition (Duty)
AMTEC Less Armament L . Lawmen'sand | Lou's Police Security SSD .
Group 1 Handcuffs, Legcuffs, Waistchains, Keys, etc. Lethal Systems, |  Systems and = < Dana Safety Supply _G"_" BLE Shooters' Distributors, | Safariland, LLC | Equipment SRISUERLY INTERNATIONA EASER teinational,
Inc. A Distributors Inc . INC. Inc.
Inc. Procedures, INC Supply, Inc. Inc. Corporation L, INC.
Line No Manufacturer/ Brand® MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.##%]
1 ASP 20.00% [ [
2 CTS 30.00%
4 Peerless 38.00% 40.00%
6 Smith & Wesson 20.50% 38.00%
AMTEC Less Armament e L Lawmen's and Lou's Police Security SSD .
Group 2 Pepper Spray/OC Spray Lethal Systems, | Systems and ¢ C N Dana Safety Supply _Gu_lf St Shooters' Distributors, | Safariland, LLC Equipment SArSUALY INTERNATIONA SR
Inc. Distributors Inc . INC. Inc.
Inc. Procedures, INC Supply, Inc. Inc. Corporation L, INC.
Line No Manufacturer/ Brand® MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.##%]
1 ASP 20.00%
3 Clear Out 30.00%
5 CTS Defense 30.00%
6 Defense Technology 20.00%
7 Punch 30.00%
8 Sabre 33.50%
9 Sage Control 1000% | 5.00% |
10 TOP COP 1.01-53.27%
4o 7 A P L AMTEC Less Armament o Lawmen's and Lou's Police Security SSD
Group 3 Tral.nlng N .Materlals . (g Lethal Systems, | Systems and e ¢ A Dana Safety Supply _G“_If States Shooters' Distributors, | Safariland, LLC Equipment SRISUREY INTERNATIONA ASEREStional
equipment and training ammunition) Inc. Procedures, INC 4 c DEUIbutor e Supply, Inc. Inc. Corporation (e L, INC. c
Line No Manufacturer/ Brand" MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.4##%]
1 ASP 20.00%
3 Cyalume 25.00% 26.00%
10 Remington 35.00%
11 Rings 25.00% 21.00%
12 Sabre 33.50%
14 Simunition 6.00% 3.00%
19 Commonwealth 10.00%
20 Hornady 50.50% | 31.00% | 40.00% | 46.00%
21 Magtech 32.00%
22 S.T. Action 3.00%
23 Sellier & Bellot 32.00%
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ITB No. 19-4600000

Defense Products

Bid Tabulation Worksheet

(REV 23 July 2015)

Group 7 Handgun Ammunition (Duty)

Group 8 Shotgun and Rimfire Ammunition (Duty)

Group 9 Rifle Ammunition (Duty)
Key
1- rand: The Man

Brand is the Industry Name that the equipment is sold under.

2 - MSRP Discount [##.##%]: The MSRP Discount is the statewide discount used to obtain the individual price (per section 4.3 Pricing).

P q q AMTEC Less Armament e L Lawmen's and Lou's Police Security SSD
Group 4 TS ERE LT 0 st (e, e, Lethal Systems, | Systems and & Dana Safety Supply .Gu.lf States Shooters' Distributors, | Safariland, LLC Equipment SRR INTERNATIONA EASERIptetnationzl
gear bags, etc.) Inc. Procedures, INC Inc. DI (I Supply, Inc. Inc. Corporation NG L INC. I,
LineNo _|Manufacturer/ Brand’ MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.#1i%]
1 Bianchi 25.00%
2 Blackhawk 40.00% 46.00%
3 Blue Force Gear 29.00%
4 B-Square 5.00%
6 Hatch 5.00%
8 Kleen Bore 5.00%
9 Monadnock 15.00%
13 Sabre 33.50%
14 Safariland 25.00%
16 Speedfeed 5.00%
Breakfree (not a brand requested by state.) 5.00%
" . n - AMTEC Less Armament e . Lawmen's and Lou's Police Securi SSD N
Groups ot Cearan e MR (G ERRS | [ Systems, | Systems and ¢ Dana Safety supply | _ CUlf States Shooters’ Distributors, | Safariland, LLC Equipm:ynt SRTSUPPLY |\ rernaTIONA | TASER International,
orstun/guns) Inc. Procedures, INC | " Inc. LSS Supply, Inc. Inc. Corporation INC. L, INC. fnc.
Line No Manufacturer/ Brand® MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.44%]
1 5.11 Tactical [ 3000% |
2 ASP 20.00%
3 Blackhawk 40.00% 46.00%
6 CTs 30.00% ]
7 Damascus 34.00% 35.00%
11 Paulson 36.00% 20.00%
1% for helmets and
14 Premier Crown riot shields 11% for 12.00%
all other items.
16 Taser " 0% V\(e do not
offer discounts"
AMTEC Less Armament 5 . Lawmen's and Lou's Police Security SSD
Group 6 Grenade.s (mu?zle ket TGS mess Gifei) & Sete Lethal Systems, |  Systems and e Dana Safety Supply .Gu.lf States Shooters' Distributors, | Safariland, LLC Equipment SR SUPPLY INTERNATIONA aSERI i aticnal
Bombs (including launchers) Inc. Procedures, INC * (o PleiEs e Supply, Inc. Inc. Corporation (e L, INC. o
szl L SIEREE NI 2
Line No Manufacturer/ Brand" MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.44%]
1 ALS 0-44.92% | | [
5 Sage Control | 10.00%
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ITB No. 19-4600

Defense Products

(REV 23 July 2015)

Group 7 Handgun Ammunition (Duty)

MSRP DISCOUNT* [##.##%]
Line | Manufacturer/ Brand® Handgun Spec. ’
AMTEC Less Armament . Lawmen's an y " " SSD
Lethal Systems, | Systems and RN Commonwealth (R ASES || e Gy || LB G Safariland, LL | SeCurity Eauil SRTSUPPLY INC. | INTERNATIONAL, TASER
Systems, Inc. Ammunition Supply Distributors Inc Distributors, Inc. Corporation International, Inc.
Inc. Procedures, INC Inc. INC.
2 Hornady .25 Automatic Colt Pistol or .25 Auto No Bid No Bid 31.00% No Bid No Bid 46.00% No Bid
4 Hornady .30 Luger 31.00% No Bid
5 Hornady .32 Automatic Colt Pistol or .32 Auto 31.00%
6 Hornady .32 H&R Magnum 31.00% 46.00%
7 Hornady .32 North American Arms 31.00% 46.00%
11 Hornady .357 Magnum 46.00%
13 Hornady .357 SIG Sauer 46.00%
15 Hornady .38 Smith & Wesson No Bid
16 Hornady .38 Special 46.00%
17 Hornady .38 Super No Bid
18 Hornady .380 Automatic Colt Pistol or .380 Auto 46.00%
20 Hornady .40 Smith & Wesson 46.00%
25 Hornady .44 Remington Magnum No Bid
27 Hornady .44 Special 46.00%
28 Hornady .44-40 Winchester No Bid
30 Hornady .45 Automatic Colt Pistol or .45 Auto 46.00%
32 Hornady .45 Long Colt 46.00%
34 Hornady .454 Casull
35 Hornady .460 Smith & Wesson Magnum 31.00%
36 Hornady .480 Ruger 31.00%
37 Hornady .50 Actign Express No Bid 31.00% No Bid No Bid
38 Hornady .500 Smith & Wesson Magnum 31.00%
39 Hornady 10mm Auto 31.00%
41 Hornady 7.62mm Nagant 31.00%
42 Hornady 7.62x25 Tokarev 31.00%
43 Hornady 9mm Luger or 9x19mm 50.50% 46.00%
44 Hornady 9mm Makarov or 9x18mm 50.50% No Bid 46.00%
46 Hornady 9x18mm Ultra or 9mm Police 50.50% No Bid NoBid |
5 Magtech .32 Automatic Colt Pistol or .32 Auto No Bid 32.00%
8 Magtech .32 Smith & Wesson 32.00%
11 Magtech .357 Magnum 32.00%
16 Magtech .38 Special 32.00%
18 Magtech .380 Automatic Colt Pistol or .380 Auto 32.00%
20 Magtech .40 Smith & Wesson 32.00%
25 Magtech .44 Remington Magnum 32.00%
30 Magtech .45 Automatic Colt Pistol or .45 Auto 32.00%
32 Magtech .45 Long Colt 32.00%
34 Magtech .454 Casull 32.00%
38 Magtech .500 Smith & Wesson Magnum 32.00%
43 Magtech 9mm Luger or 9x19mm 32.00%
11 Remington .357 Magnum 52.00% No Bid
13 Remington .357 SIG Sauer 52.00%
14 Remington .38 Short Colt 52.00%
15 Remington .38 Smith & Wesson 52.00%
16 Remington .38 Special 52.00%
18 Remington .380 Automatic Colt Pistol or .380 Auto 52.00%
20 Remington .40 Smith & Wesson 52.00%
23 Remington .41 Remington Magnum 52.00%
25 i .44 Remil Magnum 52.00%
27 .44 Special 52.00%
30 .45 Automatic Colt Pistol or .45 Auto 52.00%
32 .45 Long Colt 52.00%
43 9mm Luger or 9x19mm 52.00%
2 Sellier & Bellot .25 Automatic Colt Pistol or .25 Auto 32.00%
5 Sellier & Bellot .32 Automatic Colt Pistol or .32 Auto 32.00%
9 Sellier & Bellot .32 Smith & Wesson Long 32.00%
11 Sellier & Bellot .357 Magnum 32.00%
16 Sellier & Bellot .38 Special 32.00%
18 Sellier & Bellot .380 Automatic Colt Pistol or .380 Auto 32.00%
20 Sellier & Bellot .40 Smith & Wesson 32.00%
23 Sellier & Bellot .41 Remington Magnum 32.00%
30 Sellier & Bellot .45 Automatic Colt Pistol or .45 Auto 32.00%
32 Sellier & Bellot .45 Long Colt 32.00%
43 Sellier & Bellot 9mm Luger or 9x19mm 32.00%
2 Winchester .25 Automatic Colt Pistol or .25 Auto 31.00% No Bid
5 Winchester .32 Automatic Colt Pistol or .32 Auto 31.00% No Bid
11 Winchester .357 Magnum 31.00%
13 Winchester .357 SIG Sauer 31.00%
16 Winchester .38 Special 31.00%
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ITB No. 19-4600000 Defense Products

Tabulation Worksheet

(REV 23 July 2015)

Group 7 Handgun Ammunition (Duty)

MSRP DISCOUNT? [i##.44%]

Security Equipment
Corporation

SRT SUPPLY INC.

SSD
INTERNATIONAL,
INC.

Line | Manufacturer/ Brand® Handgun Spec. ’
Commonwealth Gulf States SI: :’t'::"ssu:::y Lou's Police Safariland, LLC
Ammunition Distributors Inc pay ” | Distributors, Inc. '
17 Winchester .38 Super
18 Winchester 380 Automatic Colt Pistol or .380 Auto
20 Winchester .40 Smith & Wesson
23 Winchester .41 Remington Magnum
30 Winchester .45 Automatic Colt Pistol or .45 Auto
31 Winchester .45 Glock Automatic Pistol "GAP"
39 Winchester 10mm Auto
43 Winchester 9mm Luger or 9x19mm
48 9x23mm Winchester
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ITB No. 19-46000000-N; Defense Products

Bid Tabulation Worksheet

(REV 23 July 2015)

Group 8 Shotgun and Rimfire Ammunition (Duty)

Shotgun Ammunition

MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.4#%]

Armament .
AMTEC Less Systems | Combined Commonwe Gulf States Lawmen's Lou's Police . Security SSD TASER
. 1 Lethal alth Dana Safety| . . and . Safariland, ) SRT SUPPLY .
Line Manufacturer/ Brand Gun Spec. and Systems, . Distributors , | Distributors Equipment INTERNATI | Internation
Systems, Ammunitio Supply Shooters' LLC A INC.
Procedures, Inc. Inc , Inc. Corporation ONAL, INC. al, Inc.
Inc. INC n Supply, Inc.
2 Hornady 12 Gauge No Bid 50.50% No Bid 46.00% No Bid
4 Hornady 20 Gauge No Bid 31.00% No Bid No Bid
2 Remington 12 Gauge No Bid 52.00%
4 Remington 20 Gauge 52.00%
2 Sellier & Bellot 12 Gauge No Bid 32.00%
2 Winchester 12 Gauge 31.00% No Bid
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ITB No. 19-46000000-N; Defense Products

Bid Tabulation Worksheet

(REV 23 July 2015)
Group 8 Shotgun and Rimfire Ammunition (Duty)
Rim Fire Ammunition
MSRP DISCOUNT? [##.##%)]
Line Manufacturer/ Gun Spec.
1 Armament f ' i
Brand AMTEC Groaais : Commonw Dana Gulf States Lawmen's L0|:| s ) Sef:urlty SRT sSD TASER
Less Lethal Combined ealth L. and Police [ Safariland, | EQuipment )
and . Safety | Distributor N 5 SUPPLY | INTERNATI [Internation
Systems, Systems, Inc.| Ammunitio Shooters' | Distributor LLC Corporatio
Procedures Supply s Inc INC. ONAL, INC.| al, Inc.
Inc. n Supply, Inc.| s, Inc. n
,INC
7 Hornady .17 Hornady Magnum Rimfire "HMR" No Bid 31.00% No Bid No Bid 46.00% No Bid
8 Hornady .17 Winchester Super Magnum 31.00% 46.00%
10 Hornady .22 Magnum Rimfire 31.00% 46.00%
7 Remington .17 Hornady Magnum Rimfire "HMR" 35.00%
9 Remington .22 Long Rifle Rimfire No Bid 35.00%
10 Remington .22 Magnum Rimfire 35.00%
9 Winchester .22 Long Rifle Rimfire 31.00% | NoBid
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ITB

19-46000000-N; Defense Pro
Tabulation Worksheet

(REV 23 July 2015)

cts

Group 9 Rifle Ammunition (Duty)

MSRP DISCOUNT® [##.##%

Line 8 Handgun Spec. AMTEC
DR A /e € P Less s::::::': d Combined Cumar:l:nwe Dana Gulf States Lawmen's and| Lou's Police safariland, Security SRT SUPPLY SSD TASER
Lethal Systems, .. | Safety | Distril hi P Di ! Equipment INTERNATIONA | International,
Procedures, Ammunitio LLC N INC.
Systems, INC Inc. n Supply Inc Supply, Inc. Inc. Corporation L, INC. Inc.
Inc.

1 Hornady -222 Remington No Bid No Bid 31.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Hornady .22-250 Remington 31.00%

3 Hornady .223 Remington and 5.56 NATO 50.50% 46.00%

4 Hornady .223 Winchester and 5.56 No Bid 46.00%

6 Hornady .257 Roberts 31.00%

7 Hornady .257 Weatherby Magnum No Bid 31.00% No Bid No Bid

8 Hornady .275 Rigby 31.00%

10 Hornady .30 Thompson/Center No Bid 46.00%
11 Hornady 300 AAC Blackout "300 BLK" 46.00%
17 Hornady .300 Weatherby Magnum 31.00% No Bid
18 Hornady .300 Whisper

19 Hornady .300 Winchester Magnum 46.00%
21 Hornady .30-06 Springfield 46.00%
2 Hornady 303 British No Bid
27 Hornady .308 Winchester and 7.62x51 NATO 46.00%
29 Hornady .338 Lapua Magnum No Bid
30 Hornady .338 Marlin Express 31.00%

33 Hornady .338 Winchester Magnum 31.00% No Bid

36 Hornady .358 Winchester 31.00%

38 Hornady .450 Bushmaster 31.00% 40.00%

39 Hornady .450 Marlin 31.00%

40 Hornady .450 Nitro Express 31.00% No Bid 46.00%
41 Hornady .450/400 Nitro Express 31.00% No Bid
43 Hornady .50 BMG 50.50% 46.00%
46 Hornady 5.45x39mm No Bid No Bid 40.00% No Bid
48 Hornady 6.5 Grendel 50.50% 40.00%

52 Hornady 6.5x55 Swedish No Bid 31.00% No Bid

55 Hornady 6.8mm Remington SPC 50.50% 46.00%
57 Hornady 7.62x39mm No Bid 31.00% 40.00% No Bid

3 Magtech .223 Remington and 5.56 NATO No Bid No Bid 32.00%

3 Remington .223 Remington and 5.56 NATO 35.00% No Bid

9 Remington .30 Carbine 35.00%

11 Remington .300 AAC Blackout "300 BLK" 35.00%

13 Remington .300 Remington Short Action Ultra Mag 35.00%

14 Remington .300 Remington Ultra Magnum 35.00%

19 Remington .300 Winchester Magnum 35.00%

21 Remington .30-06 Springfield 35.00%

27 Remington .308 Winchester and 7.62x51 NATO 35.00%

29 Remington .338 Lapua Magnum 35.00%

55 Remington 6.8mm Remington SPC 35.00%

57 Remington 7.62x39mm 35.00%

3 Sellier & Bellot  |.223 Remington and 5.56 NATO No Bid 32.00%

9 Sellier & Bellot |.30 Carbine 32.00%
21 Sellier & Bellot  [.30-06 Springfield 32.00%
27 Sellier & Bellot  |.308 Winchester and 7.62x51 NATO 32.00%
29 Sellier & Bellot  [.338 Lapua Magnum 32.00%
55 Sellier & Bellot  |6.8mm Remington SPC 32.00%

3 Winchester .223 Remington and 5.56 NATO 31.00% No Bid
27 Winchester .308 Winchester and 7.62x51 NATO 31.00%
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