STATE OF FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: ITB-DOT-17/18-9026-SJ FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE OPENING DATE: 10/10/2017 TIME: 3:00 P.M.
TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3),

BID TITLE: Guardrails and Accessories FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST OPENEND BY:_K. Walls
THE BOND OR OTHER SECURITY REQUIRED
BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR WITNESSED BY:_S. Johnson

FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER
OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120,
FLORIDA STATUTES.

POSTING DATE/TIME FROM: Friday, Oct. 20, 2017 @ 5:00PM LOCAL TIME UNTIL: Wednesday, Oct. 25, 2017 @ 5:00PM LOCAL TIME

VENDOR PRICE INTENDED AWARD

Pride Enterprises
Cloverleaf Corporation
RJP Enterprises Inc.

See below for line item pricing and intended
award(s).

[JReceipt of No Competitive Bids Evaluated by: Tim Allen and Gloria Dixon

JUSTIFICATION FOR AWARD OF SINGLE BID: Only responsive and responsible bid received (Single Bid Award Items: 1-11, 20, 23, 25, 38, 45, and 48)

The Intended Award indicates apparent awarded vendor, but does not constitute an acceptance of any offer created by vendor's bid. No binding contract
will be deemed to exist until such time as a Purchase Order or written acceptance by the Department has been issued. If irregularities are subsequently
discovered in the vendor's bid or if the vendor fails to submit required Bonds and Insurance, or otherwise fails to comply with the bid requirements, the
Department has the Right to Award to the vendor that is second low, reject all bids, or act in the best interest of the Department.

INote: The intended award for Item No. 41 has been revised. See below for details.



Vendor:

Pride Enterprises

Cloverleaf Corp.

RJP Enterprises Inc.

Intended Award

ltems:
1 No Bid No Bid $1,950.00 RJP Enterprises
2 No Bid No Bid $1,650.00 RJP Enterprises
3 No Bid No Bid $1,600.00 RJP Enterprises
4 No Bid No Bid $1,880.00 RJP Enterprises
5 No Bid No Bid $1,915.00 RJP Enterprises
6 No Bid No Bid $2,020.00 RJP Enterprises
7 No Bid No Bid $2,090.00 RJP Enterprises
8 No Bid No Bid $1,530.00 RJP Enterprises
9 No Bid No Bid $1,940.00 RJP Enterprises
10 No Bid No Bid $2,145.00 RJP Enterprises
11 No Bid No Bid $3,850.00 RJP Enterprises
12 No Bid $2,800.00 $4,495.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
13 No Bid $1,680.00 $2,610.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
14 No Bid $1,680.00 $,2610.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
15 No Bid $39.00 $45.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
16 No Bid $32.50 $42.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
17 No Bid $2.20 $4.50 Cloverleaf Corp.
18 No Bid $68.00 $95.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
19 No Bid $140.00 $180.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
20 No Bid No Bid $15.00 RJP Enterprises
21 No Bid $125.00 $165.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
22 No Bid $245.00 $270.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
23 No Bid No Bid $25.00 RJP Enterprises
24 No Bid $67.00 $90.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
25 No Bid No Bid $95.00 RJP Enterprises
26 No Bid $70.00 $90.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
27 $15.05 No Bid $30.00 PRIDE Enterprises
28 $23.80 No Bid $50.00 PRIDE Enterprises
29 $24.83 No Bid $45.00 PRIDE Enterprises
30 No Bid $39.00 $50.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
31 $4.06 No Bid $6.25 PRIDE Enterprises
32 $4.65 No Bid $6.95 PRIDE Enterprises
33 No Bid $5.00 $6.75. Cloverleaf Corp.
34 No Bid $10.00 $14.00 Cloverleaf Corp.




Vlfenrggr Pride Enterprises Cloverleaf Corp. RJP Enterprises Inc. Intended Award
35 No Bid $0.63 $925.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
36 No Bid $2.73 $425.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
37 No Bid $0.95 $825.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
38 No Bid No Bid $975.00 RJP Enterprises
39 No Bid $0.79 $575.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
40 No Bid $0.79 $525.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
411 No Bid $2.10 $325.00 / $3.25 Cloverleaf Corp.
42 No Bid $3.04 $435.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
43 No Bid $2.89 $440.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
44 No Bid $1.52 $470.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
45 No Bid No Bid $420.00 RJP Enterprises
46 No Bid $3.74 $500.00 RJP Enterprises
47 No Bid $4.60 $295.00 RJP Enterprises
48 No Bid No Bid $390.00 RJP Enterprises
49 No Bid $5.41 $700.00 Cloverleaf Corp.
50 No Bid $4.28 $550.00 RJP Enterprises

INote: The intended award for Item No. 41 was revised from RJP Enterprises to Cloverleaf Corporation.




