
Bid: State of Florida, Fine Art Insurance
ITB: 27-84131500-H 

To be eligible for award:
1.  Cells where rates or premiums are required are highlighted in yellow.  The worksheet is locked and will move to these cells only.
2.  Bidders may bid for either Policy Period 1; Policy Periods 1 and 2; Policy Periods 1, 2 and 3; or Policy Periods 1, 2, 3 and 4.   No other combination of policy periods will be accepted.
3.  Bids for mulitiple Policy Periods shall be discounted for evaluation purposes in accordance with Basis of Award section of the ITB.
4.  Bidders must provide pricing for both Indoor and Outdoor coverage.
5.  INDOOR COVERAGE:

5.1 Bidders must provide an annual premium price for each aggregate limit shown in the table below.
5.2 Bidders must provide an annual premium rate per $100 of the total insured value for the addition of any new Named Insured values added after policy inception
5.3 Transit shall be included at no additional cost.

6.  OUTDOOR COVERAGE
6.1 Bidders must provide an annual rate per $100 of the total insured value      Bidders not submitting pricing for Policy Periods 2, 3 or 4 should not input any data into those pricing fields; 
6.2 Bids for multiple Policy Periods shall be discounted in accordance with Section 2.6 of the ITB.      pricing fields are coded for a numeric response,  and anything other than a numeric response will render an 

    error code in the Calculated Premium cell.   Non conforming price sheets may be deemed non-responsive.
Period

Rate

 Aggregate 
DOS Department of State 4,500,000.00$     
UCF University of Central Florida 3,500,000.00$     
UF University of Florida 2,500,000.00$     
UNF University of North Florida 2,500,000.00$     
DMS - GOV Department of Management Services - Governor's Mansion 2,000,000.00$     
UWF - PMFA University of West Florida - Pensacola Museum of Fine Arts 2,000,000.00$     
FAMU Florida Agricultural and Mechanical University 2,000,000.00$     
FGCU Florida Gulf Coast University 2,000,000.00$     
Shared Aggregate 11 other Named Insured 2,000,000.00$     
FIU Foundation Florida International University - Foundation 500,000.00$        
FIU - CL Florida International University - College of Law 300,000.00$        
UCF - FH University of Central Florida - Flying Horse Gallery 100,000.00$        

23,900,000.00$   

-$                -$                 -$                 -$                 

 Insured value Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

100,000.00$        -$                 -$                 -$                  -$                  -$                  -$                  -$                  -$                  

-$                -$                 -$                 -$                 

0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 
0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 
0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 
0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 

Total Premium Including Assessments and Fees -$                -$                 -$                 -$                 

Discounted Premium Including Assessments and Fees -$                NO BID NO BID NO BID

-$                

Period
Rate

 Total Insured 
Value 

Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

Rate Per $100 
of Value

Estimated 
Premium

4,085,029.99$     -$                 -$                 -$                  -$                  -$                  -$                  -$                  -$                  

-$                -$                 -$                 -$                 

0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 
0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 
0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 
0.00% -$                0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 0.00% -$                 

Total Premium Including Assessments and Fees -$                -$                 -$                 -$                 

Discounted Premium Including Assessments and Fees -$                NO BID NO BID NO BID

-$                

Total Combined Scored Premium -$                      →

 Fees (insert name of Fee)

Named Insured

Premium Sub-Total

FL Insurance Assessment (insert name of fee)
 Fees (insert name of Fee)
 Fees (insert name of Fee)

OUTDOOR Scored Premium

ALL CURRENT OUTDOOR NAMED INSURED

OUTDOOR COVERAGE

New Named Insured - INDOOR COVERAGE 

Named Insured

Aggregate Premium Sub-Total

Aggregate and New NI Premium Sub-Total

Policy Period 1                                                                                 
12/31/18-12/31/19

 Fees (insert name of Fee)

Named Insured

INDOOR COVERAGE

Policy Period 2                                                                                   
12/31/19-12/31/20

Policy Period 3                                                                                   
12/31/20-12/31/21

Policy Period 4                                                                                  
12/31/21-12/31/22

1 2 3
2.25% 2.25% 2.25%

TOTAL COMBINED AGGREGATE

FL Insurance Assessment (insert name of fee)
 Fees (insert name of Fee)
 Fees (insert name of Fee)

INDOOR Scored Premium

Policy Period 4                                                                                  
12/31/21-12/31/22

Attachment E
Price Sheet

1
2.25%

2
2.25%

3
2.25%

Policy Period 1                                                                                 
12/31/18-12/31/19

Policy Period 2                                                                                   
12/31/19-12/31/20

Policy Period 3                                                                                   
12/31/20-12/31/21

Annual Premium
-$                                              

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              

Annual Premium

-$                                           
-$                                           

Annual Premium Annual Premium
-$                                              

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              

-$                                              

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              

-$                                           

-$                                           
-$                                           
-$                                           
-$                                           

-$                                           

-$                                           
-$                                           
-$                                           
-$                                           

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              

-$                                              

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              

-$                                              

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              

-$                                              

-$                                              

-$                                              
-$                                              
-$                                              


	Indoor & Outdoor FA

