STATE OF FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: ITB-DOT-15/16-9042-CA FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE OPENING DATE: 03/18/16 TIME: 3:00 P.M.
TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3),

BID TITLE: Grass Seed FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST OPENEND BY:__Sherill R. Johnson
THE BOND OR OTHER SECURITY REQUIRED
BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR WITNESSED BY: Cassandra Anderson

FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER
OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120,
FLORIDA STATUTES.

POSTING DATE/TIME FROM:; March 28, 2016 @ 5:00 PM EST UNTIL: March 31, 2016 @ 5:00 PM EST
BIDDERS
Pennington Seed, Inc.
SiteOne Landscape Supply PLEASE SEE ATTACHED PAGES BELOW.

Central Florida Seed, Inc.

[IReceipt of No Competitive Bids Evaluated by: Dale Cook and Gloria Dixon

JUSTIFICATION FOR AWARD OF SINGLE BID: The vendor, Central Florida Seed, Inc., is the only responsive and responsible bidder on Item# 3,
Districts 1-7.

Xintended Award was determined by utilizing an In-State Preference in accordance with s.287.084, Florida Statutes (check box when applicable).

X Indicates apparent awarded vendor, but does not constitute an acceptance of any offer created by vendor's bid. No binding contract will be deemed to exist

until such time as a Purchase Order or written acceptance by the Department has been issued. If irregularities are subsequently discovered in the vendor's bid
or if the vendor fails to submit required Bonds and Insurance, or otherwise fails to comply with the bid requirements, the Department has the Right to Award to
the vendor that is second low, reject all bids, or act in the best interest of the Department.



BID NUMBER: ITB-DOT-15/16-9042-CA

VENDOR: 1. Annual Rye/Bag 2. Bahia/Bag Pensacola
PRICE PER 50 LB BAG PRICE PER 50 LB BAG
Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered
Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref. Price Bid | 5% Pref.
DISTRICT 1
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 26.00 l 27.30 26.00 X | 27.30 No Bid 140.00 | 147.00 140.00 | 147.00
SiteOne Landscape Supply 29.50 | 30.98 29.50 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
***Central Florida Seed 32.90 31.00 32.90 144.00 141.90 144.00 X
District 2
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 26.00 27.30 26.00 X 27.30 No Bid 140.00 140.00 147.00
SiteOne Landscape Supply 29.50 30.98 29.50 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
***Central Florida Seed 32.90 31.00 32.90 141.90 139.90 141.90 X
District 3
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 26.00 27.30 26.00 X 27.30 No Bid 140.00 147.00 140.00 147.00
SiteOne Landscape Supply 29.50 30.98 29.50 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
***Central Florida Seed 32.90 31.00 32.90 144.00 141.90 144.00 X
District 4
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 26.00 27.30 26.00 X 27.30 No Bid 140.00 147.00 140.00 147.00
SiteOne Landscape Supply 29.50 30.98 29.50 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
***Central Florida Seed 32.90 31.00 32.90 144.00 141.90 144.00 X
District 5
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 26.00 27.30 26.00 X 27.30 No Bid 140.00 140.00 147.00
SiteOne Landscape Supply 29.50 30.98 29.50 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
***Central Florida Seed 32.90 31.00 32.90 141.90 139.90 141.90 X
DISTRICT 6
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 26.00 27.30 26.00 X 27.30 No Bid 140.00 147.00 140.00 147.00
SiteOne Landscape Supply 29.50 30.98 29.50 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
***Central Florida Seed 32.90 31.00 32.90 144.00 141.90 144.00 X

**Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Pennington Seed is the low bidder for Item 1: Districts 1-7; Item 4: Districts 1-7; Item 5: District 1-7
***Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Central Florida Seed is the low bidder for Item 2: District 1-7; Item 3: Single Response for Districts 1-7




BID NUMBER: ITB-DOT-15/16-9042-CA

VENDOR: 1. Annual Rye/Bag 2. Bahia/Bag Pensacola
PRICE PER 50 LB BAG PRICE PER 50 LB BAG
Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered
Price Bid | 5% Pref. Price Bid | 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. Price Bid| 5% Pref. | Price Bid 5% Pref.
District 7
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 26.00 27.30 26.00 X 27.30 No Bid 140.00 147.00 140.00 147.00
SiteOne Landscane 29.50 | 30.98 29.50 29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
***Central Florida Seed 32.90 31.00 32.90 144.00 141.90 144.00 X
3. Bahia/Bag Argentina 4. Brown Top Millet/Bag
PRICE PER 50 LB BAG PRICE PER 50 LB BAG
Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered
Price Bid | 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. Price Bid | 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref.
DISTRICT 1
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.50 | 28.88 27.50 X | 28.88
SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.50 38.50 38.50
***Central Florida Seed 268.00 265.00 268.00 X 34.00 32.00 34.00
District 2
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.50 28.88 27.50 X 28.88
SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.50 38.50 38.50
***Central Florida Seed 259.00 256.00 259.00 X 31.90 29.90 31.90
District 3
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.50 28.88 27.50 X 28.88
SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.50 38.50 38.50
***Central Florida Seed 268.00 265.00 268.00 X 34.00 32.00 34.00
District 4
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.50 28.88 27.50 X 28.88
SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.50 38.50 38.50
***Central Florida Seed 268.00 265.00 268.00 X 34.00 32.00 34.00

**Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Pennington Seed is the low bidder for Item 1: Districts 1-7; Item 4: Districts 1-7; Item 5: District 1-7
***Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Central Florida Seed is the low bidder for Item 2: District 1-7; Item 3: Single Response for Districts 1-7



BID NUMBER: ITB-DOT-15/16-9042-CA

3. Bahia/Bag Argentina

4. Brown Top Millet/Bag

PRICE PER 50 LB BAG

PRICE PER 50 LB BAG

Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered
Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. |Price Bid | 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref. | PriceBid | 5% Pref.
District 5
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2750 | 2888 750X | 2888
SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.50 38.50 38.50
***Central Florida Seed 259.00 256.00 259.00 X 31.90 29.90 31.90
District 6
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.50 28.88 27.50 X 28.88
SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.50 38.50 38.50
***Central Florida Seed 268.00 265.00 268.00 X 34.00 32.00 34.00
District 7
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.50 28.88 27.50 X 28.88
SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.50 38.50 38.50
***Central Florida Seed 259.00 256.00 259.00 X 34.00 32.00 34.00

**Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Pennington Seed is the low bidder for Item 1: Districts 1-7; Item 4: Districts 1-7; Item 5: District 1-7
***Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Central Florida Seed is the low bidder for Item 2: District 1-7; Item 3: Single Response for Districts 1-7




BID NUMBER: ITB-DOT-15/16-9042-CA

5. Bermuda Unhulled/Bag

PRICE PER 50 LB BAG

Bulk Delivery Pick-up Delivered
Price Bid ‘ 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref. | Price Bid | 5% Pref.
DISTRICT 1
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 165.00 | 173.25 | 165.00 X | 173.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply | 197.50 207.38 197.50 197.50
***Central Florida Seed 200.00 198.00 200.00
District 2
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 165.00 173.25 165.00 X 173.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply 197.50 197.50 197.50
***Central Florida Seed 195.90 194.00 195.90
DISTRICT 3
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 165.00 173.25 165.00 X 173.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply | 197.50 207.38 197.50 197.50
***Central Florida Seed 200.00 198.00 200.00
District 4
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 165.00 173.25 165.00 X 173.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply | 197.50 207.38 197.50 197.50
***Central Florida Seed 200.00 198.00 200.00
District 5
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 165.00 173.25 165.00 X 173.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply 197.50 197.50 197.50
***Central Florida Seed 195.90 194.00 195.90
District 6
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 165.00 173.25 165.00 X 173.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply | 197.50 207.38 197.50 197.50
***Central Florida Seed 200.00 198.00 200.00
District 7
**Pennington Seed, Inc. No Bid 165.00 173.25 165.00 X 173.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply | 197.50 207.35 197.50 197.50
***Central Florida Seed 200.00 198.00 200.00

**Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Pennington Seed is the low bidder for Item 1: Districts 1-7; Item 4: Districts 1-7; Item 5: District 1-7
***Special Condition 8: In-State Preference: 5% Price preference applied, Central Florida Seed is the low bidder for Item 2: District 1-7; Item 3: Single Response for Districts 1-7




